
 

    
 

FOI_1569_2023-24 – FOI Request concerning Escaped from all Mental 
Health Units 
 
 
I would like the following data for the period between the beginning of the financial 
year 2013/14 up to the current date. Please provide the data for each financial year: 
 
1. The number of patients that escaped from all mental health units. For each 

escaped patient, please provide: 
a) Which unit the patient escaped from (Name of unit, hospital or clinic) 

 
Ward 2013-14 2014-

15 
2015-
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2016-
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2017-
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2018-
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2019-

20 
2020-

21 
2021-

22 
2022-

23 
2023-

24 
Brooker 3 2 3 0 2 3 0 2 2 2 3 
Hawthorn
s 

33 15 11 15 16 21 17 23 11 38 35 

Maples 26 21 0 8 10 2 12 4 11 17 8 
Oakdene 13 5 1 6 3 2 3     

 
b) Whether the unit is a high, medium, or low security facility. 

We are not secure forensic service. 
 

Brooker N/A 
Hawthorns N/A 
Maples N/A 
Oakdene N/A 

 
c) The method of each escape 

The information being requested is not centrally recorded by the Trust and would 
require a manual trawl of our records. As a result of this, this part of your FOI Request 
is exempt under S12 of the FOI Act 2000 and therefore we are unable to provide this 
information. 

d) The date and time the patient announced missing 
Please see the full list on the next page showing the data each patient was announced 
missing. 

e) The date and time the escaped patient was recovered (if patient was not 
recovered, please make this clear) 

 We do not record this data 
f) Whether the escapee was serving a hospital order 
 We do not record this data 
g) If they were serving a hospital order, what was the charge 
 We do not record this data 
f) What was the escapee’s mental disorder 
 We do not record this data 



 

g) The date and time the patient announced missing. 

  
Incident 

Date 
No. of 

incidents 
2013-14 04/04/2013 1 

08/04/2013 1 
09/04/2013 2 
12/04/2013 1 
18/04/2013 1 
21/04/2013 1 
23/04/2013 1 
09/05/2013 1 
17/05/2013 1 
18/05/2013 1 
19/05/2013 1 
22/05/2013 1 
26/05/2013 1 
03/06/2013 1 
08/06/2013 2 
11/06/2013 1 
13/06/2013 1 
24/06/2013 1 
25/06/2013 1 
29/06/2013 1 
09/07/2013 1 
13/07/2013 1 
14/07/2013 1 
22/07/2013 2 
01/08/2013 2 
16/08/2013 1 
22/08/2013 1 
24/08/2013 1 
28/08/2013 1 
02/09/2013 1 
03/09/2013 2 
13/09/2013 1 
14/09/2013 2 
16/09/2013 1 
18/09/2013 1 
20/09/2013 1 
25/09/2013 1 
28/09/2013 1 
02/10/2013 1 
05/10/2013 1 
06/10/2013 1 
09/10/2013 1 



 

  
Incident 

Date 
No. of 

incidents 
31/10/2013 1 
01/11/2013 1 
03/11/2013 1 
10/11/2013 2 
15/11/2013 1 
19/11/2013 2 
29/11/2013 1 
05/12/2013 1 
07/12/2013 1 
21/12/2013 1 
26/12/2013 1 
28/12/2013 1 
06/01/2014 1 
12/01/2014 1 
19/01/2014 1 
04/02/2014 1 
05/02/2014 1 
25/02/2014 1 
02/03/2014 1 
05/03/2014 1 
19/03/2014 1 
22/03/2014 2 
26/03/2014 2 

2014-15 05/04/2014 1 
11/04/2014 1 
19/04/2014 1 
21/04/2014 1 
24/04/2014 1 
29/04/2014 1 
09/05/2014 1 
10/05/2014 2 
17/05/2014 1 
19/05/2014 1 
20/05/2014 1 
22/05/2014 1 
19/06/2014 1 
21/06/2014 1 
27/06/2014 1 
01/07/2014 2 
02/07/2014 2 
04/07/2014 1 
08/07/2014 1 
13/07/2014 1 



 

  
Incident 

Date 
No. of 

incidents 
18/07/2014 1 
31/07/2014 1 
10/08/2014 2 
18/08/2014 1 
19/08/2014 1 
20/08/2014 1 
24/08/2014 1 
13/09/2014 1 
01/10/2014 1 
12/10/2014 1 
16/10/2014 1 
25/12/2014 1 
08/01/2015 1 
20/01/2015 1 
12/02/2015 1 
13/02/2015 1 
20/02/2015 1 
26/02/2015 1 
17/03/2015 1 

2015-16 06/05/2015 1 
20/05/2015 1 
31/05/2015 1 
04/06/2015 1 
01/07/2015 1 
23/09/2015 1 
05/10/2015 1 
18/12/2015 1 
06/01/2016 1 
18/01/2016 1 
16/02/2016 1 
25/02/2016 1 
27/02/2016 1 
26/03/2016 1 
30/03/2016 1 

2016-17 13/04/2016 1 
26/04/2016 1 
16/05/2016 1 
02/06/2016 1 
12/06/2016 2 
16/06/2016 1 
17/06/2016 1 
21/06/2016 1 
24/06/2016 1 



 

  
Incident 

Date 
No. of 

incidents 
09/07/2016 1 
16/07/2016 1 
17/07/2016 1 
24/07/2016 1 
27/07/2016 1 
13/08/2016 1 
30/09/2016 1 
05/10/2016 1 
28/10/2016 1 
31/10/2016 1 
26/11/2016 1 
19/12/2016 1 
25/12/2016 1 
09/02/2017 1 
13/02/2017 1 
18/02/2017 2 
17/03/2017 1 
30/03/2017 1 

2017-18 15/04/2017 1 
13/05/2017 1 
31/05/2017 1 
07/06/2017 1 
21/06/2017 1 
23/06/2017 1 
24/06/2017 1 
04/07/2017 1 
18/07/2017 1 
05/09/2017 1 
14/09/2017 1 
29/09/2017 1 
08/10/2017 1 
10/11/2017 1 
17/11/2017 1 
21/11/2017 1 
23/11/2017 1 
29/12/2017 1 
05/01/2018 1 
18/01/2018 1 
24/01/2018 1 
05/02/2018 1 
12/02/2018 1 
17/02/2018 1 
18/02/2018 1 



 

  
Incident 

Date 
No. of 

incidents 
22/02/2018 1 
03/03/2018 1 
10/03/2018 1 
11/03/2018 1 
25/03/2018 2 

2018-19 01/04/2018 1 
26/04/2018 1 
28/04/2018 2 
14/05/2018 1 
16/05/2018 1 
01/06/2018 1 
06/06/2018 1 
14/06/2018 1 
13/07/2018 1 
06/08/2018 1 
01/09/2018 1 
03/09/2018 2 
19/09/2018 1 
10/10/2018 1 
13/10/2018 1 
12/11/2018 1 
15/11/2018 1 
12/01/2019 1 
13/01/2019 1 
28/01/2019 1 
29/01/2019 1 
12/02/2019 1 
15/02/2019 1 
16/02/2019 1 
21/02/2019 1 
01/03/2019 1 

2019-20 04/04/2019 1 
07/04/2019 1 
14/04/2019 1 
15/04/2019 1 
16/04/2019 1 
23/04/2019 1 
25/04/2019 2 
26/04/2019 1 
27/04/2019 1 
18/05/2019 1 
06/06/2019 1 
16/06/2019 1 



 

  
Incident 

Date 
No. of 

incidents 
24/06/2019 1 
25/06/2019 2 
26/06/2019 1 
02/08/2019 1 
08/08/2019 1 
01/09/2019 1 
02/10/2019 1 
18/10/2019 1 
18/11/2019 1 
11/12/2019 1 
26/12/2019 1 
31/12/2019 1 
02/01/2020 1 
12/01/2020 1 
20/01/2020 1 
04/03/2020 1 
05/03/2020 1 
09/03/2020 1 

2020-21 08/04/2020 1 
22/04/2020 1 
03/05/2020 1 
19/05/2020 1 
25/05/2020 1 
05/06/2020 1 
18/06/2020 1 
23/06/2020 1 
06/07/2020 1 
24/07/2020 1 
03/08/2020 1 
24/08/2020 1 
05/09/2020 2 
08/09/2020 1 
05/10/2020 2 
07/10/2020 1 
15/10/2020 1 
20/10/2020 2 
23/10/2020 1 
06/01/2021 1 
13/01/2021 1 
28/01/2021 1 
29/01/2021 1 
02/02/2021 1 
15/02/2021 1 



 

  
Incident 

Date 
No. of 

incidents 
15/03/2021 1 

2021-22 12/05/2021 1 
18/06/2021 2 
06/07/2021 1 
07/07/2021 1 
15/07/2021 1 
19/08/2021 1 
28/09/2021 2 
18/10/2021 2 
24/10/2021 2 
08/11/2021 1 
13/11/2021 1 
07/12/2021 1 
20/12/2021 1 
20/01/2022 1 
11/02/2022 1 
16/02/2022 1 
01/03/2022 1 
05/03/2022 1 
30/03/2022 1 
31/03/2022 1 

2022-23 07/04/2022 2 
13/04/2022 1 
19/04/2022 1 
22/04/2022 1 
02/05/2022 1 
06/05/2022 1 
18/05/2022 1 
24/05/2022 1 
30/05/2022 2 
08/06/2022 1 
13/06/2022 1 
14/06/2022 1 
28/06/2022 1 
01/07/2022 1 
08/07/2022 1 
11/07/2022 1 
16/07/2022 1 
17/07/2022 1 
20/07/2022 1 
02/08/2022 1 
03/08/2022 1 
04/08/2022 1 



 

  
Incident 

Date 
No. of 

incidents 
14/08/2022 1 
16/08/2022 1 
18/08/2022 1 
24/08/2022 1 
30/08/2022 1 
02/09/2022 1 
07/09/2022 1 
11/09/2022 1 
22/09/2022 1 
26/09/2022 1 
27/09/2022 1 
08/10/2022 1 
11/10/2022 1 
05/11/2022 1 
13/11/2022 1 
22/11/2022 1 
25/11/2022 1 
29/11/2022 1 
01/12/2022 1 
13/12/2022 1 
19/12/2022 1 
20/12/2022 2 
06/01/2023 1 
23/01/2023 1 
01/02/2023 1 
08/02/2023 1 
22/02/2023 1 
23/02/2023 1 
02/03/2023 1 
07/03/2023 1 
15/03/2023 1 
25/03/2023 1 

2023-24 03/04/2023 1 
04/04/2023 1 
08/04/2023 2 
12/04/2023 1 
11/05/2023 1 
14/05/2023 1 
15/05/2023 1 
29/05/2023 1 
03/06/2023 1 
09/06/2023 1 
18/06/2023 1 



 

  
Incident 

Date 
No. of 

incidents 
21/06/2023 1 
25/06/2023 1 
28/06/2023 1 
11/07/2023 1 
24/07/2023 2 
05/08/2023 1 
20/08/2023 1 
26/08/2023 1 
03/10/2023 2 
06/10/2023 2 
09/10/2023 1 
24/10/2023 1 
25/10/2023 1 
03/11/2023 1 
13/11/2023 1 
14/11/2023 1 
26/11/2023 1 
27/11/2023 1 
02/12/2023 1 
04/12/2023 2 
08/12/2023 1 
12/12/2023 1 
19/12/2023 1 
20/12/2023 1 
29/12/2023 1 
02/01/2024 1 
17/01/2024 2 
19/01/2024 1 
20/01/2024 1 

  Total 409 
 


