NHS

Solent
NHS Trust

FOI_1540 2023-24 — FOI Request concerning Sexual Assaults

| am writing to request the following from your NHS trust under the Freedom of Information Act

2000:

The number of sexual assaults, rapes and sexual harassment/abuse offences reported at your
trust, for the calendar years 2021, 2022 and 2023.

1.

Please list the number of:
a) sexual assaults

b) rapes (including gang rapes - please specify)

N/A

c) sexual harassment/abuse offences reported per year

2021 2022 2023
Sexual Assaults (a) 9 10 21
Sexual Harassment / Obscene Behaviour (c) 9 21 31

Of those, please specify:
a) how many were reported to the police.
This information is not held within Ulysses.

b) how many had staff listed as a suspect, and how many had staff listed as a victim
¢) how many had a patient(s) listed as a suspect,

d) how many had a patient(s) listed as a victim

By the term suspect, it is based on the reported suspected perpetrator of the incident reported

on Ulysses
2021 2022 2023
Incidents with a staff suspect 3 4 2
(incl. non-Solent staff)
Incidents with a staff victim 11 19 36
Incidents with a patient suspect 13 22 42
Incidents with a patient victim 7 11 17

Please also specify report outcomes, i.e. how many resulted in police action, without any

identifiers
This information is not held within Ulysses.

Please also provide a copy of your sexual safety policy.
Please be advised that Solent NHS Trust do not have a sexual safety policy.

Great care at the heart of our community

Solent NHS Trust:

)




