
 

    
 

FOI_1324_2023-24 – FOI Request Concerning – CCTV use in seclusion 
and/or 136 suites 
 
1. Does your trust use CCTV cameras or other comparable equipment within 

seclusion rooms/suites and/or 136 suites/health based places of safety. Please 
state where this is used and number of locations (ie CCTV is used in 2x seclusion 
rooms and 1x 136 suite) 
 
No, these rooms are not recorded due to privacy of the patient 

 
2. If the answer is no, please state if CCTV has previously been used or if the trust are 

planning to implement this in seclusion rooms and/or 136 suites.  
 
No, these rooms are not recorded due to privacy of the patient 

 
3. If the trust has previously used CCTV or is planning to use this, please continue to 

answer the following questions in relation to the policies previously in place, or 
about to be implemented. 
 
N/A  

 
4. Please provide information detailing the consent processes for use of CCTV in 

seclusion rooms and/or 136 suites.  
 
N/A 

 
5. Please provide information detailing where the equipment is located and what can 

be viewed, for example does this include a view of both the patient bathroom and 
bedroom spaces. please include the patient population, ie older adults, CAMHS, 
secure services. 
 
N/A 

 
6. Please provide details of where the CCTV monitor screen is located (ie where the 

footage is viewed from).  
 
N/A 

 
7. please provide copies of the trust's standard operating procedures, policies and 

procedures or other relevant document outlining CCTV use in seclusion and/or 136 
suites. If these documents do not exist, please state.  
 
N/A 

 
 
 
 
 



 

8. Please provide copies of the Trust's equality impact assessment relating to use of 
CCTV in seclusion and/or 136 suites. If these documents do not exist, please state.  

 
N/S 

 
9. Please provide copies of the Trust's data protection impact assessment relating to 

use of CCTV in seclusion and/or 136 suites. If these documents do not exist, please 
state.  
 
N/A 

 
10. Please detail any patient involvement in decisions around use of CCTV in seclusion 

rooms and/or 136 suites. For example meeting minutes, patient consultation 
outcomes. If this has not occured, please state. 

 
N/A 

 
11. Details of numbers of and copies of complaints relating to CCTV use (since Jan 

2020). 
 

There have been 0 complaints relating to CCTV use since January 2020. 
 
12. Details of and numbers relating to use of CCTV footage from seclusion rooms 

and/or 136 suites in relation to court proceedings and/or coroners reports (since 
Jan 2020) 

 
0 

 
13. Details of, copies of and numbers relating to incident reports relating to trust CCTV 

use in seclusion rooms and/or 136 suites (since Jan 2020) 
 
There have been 0 incidents relating to Trust CCTV use in seclusion rooms and/or 136 
suites since January 2020. 
 

 


