
 

    

 

FOI_1220_2023-24 – FOI Request Concerning – Detention Under the Mental 
Health Act 
 
 
1. Between 1 January 2018 and 31 December 2022, how many people were detained 

under the Mental Health Act?  
 
2012 

 
a) Alongside the total, please provide a breakdown by calendar year.  

 

 
 
2. How many people detained under the Mental Health Act between 1 January 2018 and 

31 December 2022 were asylum seekers?  
 

We do not hold this data.  
 
a) Alongside the total, please provide a breakdown by calendar year.  

 

N/A 

 
3. Between 1 January 2022 and 31 May 2023, how many people were detained under 

the Mental Health Act?  
 
514 

 
a) Alongside the total, please provide a breakdown by month.  

 

 
 
4. How many people detained under the Mental Health Act between January 2022 to 

May 2023 were asylum seekers?  
 

We do not hold this data.  
 

a) Alongside the total, please provide a breakdown by month.  
 

N/A 

 


