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1. How many letters were sent via post  

2. How many appointment and appointment reminder letters sent via post 

This information is not recorded centrally and would require a manual trawl of patient 
medical records. This is therefore being exempt under Section 12 of the FOI Act. 

3. How many change of appointment letters sent via post 

This information is not recorded centrally and would require a manual trawl of patient 
medical records. This is therefore being exempt under Section 12 of the FOI Act. 

4. How much is spent on post for change of appointment letters?  

Not separately identified by Solent. 

5. How many pre-admission and pre-arrival letters sent via post 

This information is not recorded centrally and would require a manual trawl of patient medical 
records. This is therefore being exempt under Section 12 of the FOI Act. 

6. How much is spent post for pre-admission and pre-arrival letters?  

Not separately identified by Solent. 

7. How many pages are in the average letter sent via post 

This information is not recorded centrally and would require a manual trawl of patient 
medical records. This is therefore being exempt under Section 12 of the FOI Act. 

8. How much is the total printing costs of letters sent via post  

Not separately identified by Solent. 

9. How much is the total stamp / franking costs of letters sent via post  

£383,031 in 2022/23. 

10. How much is spent on post in total  

£394,347 including franking machine hire and maintenance in 2022/23. 

 


