
 

    

 

FOI_1190_2023-24 – FOI Request Concerning – Sexual Assaults in 
Hospitals 
 
Please can you provide data for the following years – 2020, 2021, 2022, 2023 to date. 
 
1. How many sexual assaults were reported to the trust? Of these allegations, please 

advise whether they were 

a) On Staff carried out by a staff Member 

b) On Staff carried out by a patient or visitor 

c) By Staff on a Patient 

d) By Staff on a visitor 

e) On Staff carried out by a visitor 

f) On a patient carried out by a patient 

This falls under Exemption Section 40 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  

2. Of these alleged offences, how many were reported to the police? 

Information not held on our incident reporting system (Ulysses)  

3. If these alleged offences involved members of staff or contractors of the trust, 

please outline whether disciplinary proceedings took place and what was the 

outcome? 

Information not held on our incident reporting system (Ulysses)  

4. How many rapes were reported to the trust? 
 
We’re unable to answer this question as these types of incidents sit under one category on 
our incident reporting system.   

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



5. Of these allegations, please advise whether they were: 

a) On Staff carried out by a staff Member 

b) On Staff carried out by a patient or visitor 

c) By Staff on a Patient 

d) By Staff on a visitor 

e) On Staff carried out by a visitor 

f) On a patient carried out by a patient 

g) Of these alleged offences, how many were reported to the police? 

We’re unable to answer this question above (A-G) as these types of incidents sit under one 
category on our incident reporting system.   

 
6. If these alleged offences involved members of staff or contractors of the trust, 

please outline whether disciplinary proceedings took place and what was the 

outcome? 

Information not held on our incident reporting system (Ulysses)  

 


