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FOI_1165 2023-24 — FOI Request Concerning — Psychiatric
Inpatient Wards - Parental and Family Data

We are seeking data covering the period from 1st January 2018 to 31st December 2019
inclusive.

1. Please provide the following data, as far as is reasonably possible:
a) Admissions Data
How many individual admissions (for one night or more) were made to each

psychiatric inpatient ward in the Trust. This question refers to all patient
admissions, not just parents.

Ward Admissions
Brooker OPMH
Hawthorn AMH
Maple Ward PICU
Grand Total 1460

These figures include internal ward movement, so if someone moves from Hawthorn to
Maples and back to Hawthorns, that is 2 admissions to Hawthorn and one to Maples

2. If possible, please provide this information disaggregated by ward, and for each
ward, please indicate:

Ward gender type (male/female/mixed)
Mean age of patients admitted during reporting period
How many of the patients reported under 1.a. were parents (as defined above)?

This information is not recorded centrally and would require a manual trawl of patient
medical records. This is therefore being exempt under Section 12 of the FOI Act

3. If possible, please provide this information disaggregated by ward, and for each
ward, please indicate:

Ward gender type (male/female/mixed)
Mean age of patients admitted during reporting period

This information is not recorded centrally and would require a manual trawl of patient
medical records. This is therefore being exempt under Section 12 of the FOI Act

4. Parental Status Data Collection
Solent NHS are not commission to provide inpatient wards for children under mental hea)
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What data are routinely collected on parental status when inpatients are admitted or
during their care?

For example, are any of the following recorded: parenthood status, parental
responsibility, children’s age, involvement of statutory services, where child
currently resides?
Is any other related information routinely recorded?
5. Trust/ward policies and procedures
Please provide copies of Trust policy documents which include reference to the
needs of psychiatric inpatients who are parents and their families (e.g. family visit

policies).

mh03-admission-discharge-transfer-of-care-policy-v3.pdf (solent.nhs.uk)

Please provide copies of any internal guidelines/SOPs used by wards to manage
child visits to wards.

COVID-19 visitor guidance | Solent NHS

Please provide a copy of each inpatient ward induction/welcome pack for
inpatients.

mh03-admission-discharge-transfer-of-care-policy-v3.pdf (solent.nhs.uk)

Please provide a copy of any written information provided to carers of inpatients.

Please provide a copy of information provided to the carers of children of
inpatients while they are inpatients (e.g. foster carer, grandparent).

Please provide a copy of any information provided to child(ren) of inpatients.
b) Child visits.

During the reporting period, how many parents received at least one visit from their
child/ren during their inpatient ward admission?

During the reporting period, how many individual visits were made by children to
inpatient psychiatric wards?

This information is not recorded centrally and would require a manual trawl of patient
medical records. This is therefore being exempt under Section 12 of the FOI Act

c) Family-friendly facilities

Please provide a description of any family visit room(s) on each inpatient ward
(include details of fixtures and fittings).

The room has heavy duty chairs and a small coffee table


https://www.solent.nhs.uk/media/3853/mh03-admission-discharge-transfer-of-care-policy-v3.pdf
https://www.solent.nhs.uk/covid-19-visitor-guidance/#:~:text=Each%20inpatient%2C%20on%20Solent%20NHS%20Trust%20ran%20wards%2C,the%20risks%20to%20your%20own%20health%20when%20visiting.
https://www.solent.nhs.uk/media/3853/mh03-admission-discharge-transfer-of-care-policy-v3.pdf

For each family room, state whether it is used solely for the purpose of family visits.
On occasions the room is used for other things on an Ad Hoc basis
Please provide a photograph of each family room (a snapshot from a phone is fine).

This information is not held by Solent



