
 

    

 

FOI_0474_21/22 – FOI request concerning - Treatment of 
Schizophrenia 
 
 
1. In the past 6 months, how many patients has your trust treated [for any 

condition] with the following drugs: 
a) Aripiprazole long-acting injectable (Abilify Maintena)   

30 
b) Olanzapine pamoate (Zypadhera)      

14 
c) Paliperidone palmitate, once monthly (Xeplion)    

79 
d) Paliperidone palmitate, three monthly (Trevicta)    

28 
e) Risperidone long-acting injectable (Risperdal Consta)   

25 
f) Flupentixol decanoate (Depixol)      

4 
g) Fluphenazine decanoate (Modecate)      

0 
h) Haloperidol decanoate (Haldol Decanoate)     

4 
i) Pipotiazine palmitate (Piportil)       

4 
j) Zuclopenthixol decanoate (Clopixol)      

7 
  
2. Within your organisation how many patients are currently [within the past 6 

months] being treated for Schizophrenia (ICD code: F20) 
 
N/A - as our medicines system does not hold diagnosis or indication for treatment data 
 

3. Of the Schizophrenia patients ONLY, how many are currently [within the past 6 
months] being treated with the following drugs: 
a) Aripiprazole long-acting injectable (Abilify Maintena) 
b) Olanzapine pamoate (Zypadhera) 
c) Paliperidone palmitate, once monthly (Xeplion) 
d) Paliperidone palmitate, three monthly (Trevicta) 
e) Risperidone long-acting injectable (Risperdal Consta) 
f) Flupentixol decanoate (Depixol) 
g) Fluphenazine decanoate (Modecate) 
h) Haloperidol decanoate (Haldol Decanoate) 
i) Pipotiazine palmitate (Piportil) 
j) Zuclopenthixol decanoate (Clopixol) 

 
N/A - as our medicines system does not hold diagnosis or indication for treatment data 

 


