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FOI_1114 2022-23 — FOI Request Concerning — Sexual Assault

1. What is the name of your trust
Solent NHS Trust
2. How many mixed-gender accommodation units does your trust have?

All of the inpatient wards at Solent are mixed gender however all sleeping accommodation,
whether individual rooms or multi-occupancy bed bays, are single sex only.

3. How many communal areas does your trust have which can be accessed by all
sexes?

We do not hold this information.
4. How many reports of rape were reported between 2021 - 2022
a. in mixed-gender accommodation
b.in acommunal area accessed by all sexes
c. on asingle sex ward
0 reports of rape 15t January 2021 — 315 December 2022

5. Of those reports how many were serious enough to refer to safeguarding which took
place

a. in mixed-gender accommodation

b.in acommunal area accessed by all sexes
c. on asingle sex ward

N/A

6. Of those reports how many were serious enough to refer to the police which took
place

a. in mixed-gender accommodation
b.in a communal area accessed by all sexes
c.on asingle sex ward

N/A

Great care at tne neart or our community &~



7. How many reports of sexual assault were reported between 2021 - 2022
a. in mixed-gender accommodation

10 on inpatient units, all of which are mixed gender but with single sex sleeping
accommodation as per question 2.

b. in acommunal area accessed by all sexes
19
c.on asingle sex ward

10 in mixed-gender accommodation and 19 in a communal area accessed by all sexes —
15t January 2021-31st December 2022

8. Of those reports how many were serious enough to refer to safeguarding which took
place

a. in mixed-gender accomodation

b.in acommunal area accessed by all sexes
c.on asingle sex ward

This information is not held within Ulysses

9. Of those reports how many were serious enough to refer to the police which took
place

a. in mixed-gender accommodation
b.in a communal area accessed by all sexes
c.on asingle sex ward
This information is not held within Ulysses
10. How many reports of sexual exploitation were reported between 2021 - 2022
a. in mixed-gender accommodation
b.in a communal area accessed by all sexes
c.on asingle sex ward
0 reports of sexual exploitation 15t January 2021 — 315t December 2022

11. Of those reports how many were serious enough to refer to safeguarding which
took place

a. in mixed-gender accommodation
b.in a communal area accessed by all sexes
c.on asingle sex ward

N/A



12

13.

14

15.

. Of those reports how many were serious enough to refer to the police which took
place

a. in mixed-gender accomodation

b.in a communal area accessed by all sexes
c.on asingle sex ward

N/A

How many reports of sexual misconduct were reported between 2021 - 2022 which
took place

a. in mixed-gender accommodation
b.in a communal area accessed by all sexes
c.on asingle sex ward
0 reports of sexual misconduct 1%t January 2021 — 315t December 2022

. Of those reports how many were serious enough to refer to safeguarding which
took place

a. in mixed-gender accommodation

b.in acommunal area accessed by all sexes
c.on asingle sex ward

N/A

Of those reports how many were serious enough to refer to the police which took
place

a. in mixed-gender accommodation
b.in a communal area accessed by all sexes

c.on asingle sex ward
N/A



