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FOI_0390 22/22 — FOI request concerning - Number of Deaths
and ICU Beds Used for Covid-19
1. Please provide the number of deaths from 2011 to 2021 listed by year.
Data is only held from 2018/19 onwards and is reported in financial years:
Year Number of Deaths
2018/19 33
2019/20 12
2020/21 16
Data provided for inpatients only.
2. Please provide the total number of ICU patients and/or ICU beds used from 2011

to 2021 listed by year. Please supply both is possible.
Solent NHS Trust is a Mental Health and Community Service Trust and therefore this

guestion is N/A.

3. Please provide the total number of deaths where flu was the main cause of death
from 2011 to 2021 listed by year.
Data not held — we do not record the cause of death. This is determined by the coroner

after the patient has died.

4. Please provide the total number of deaths where Covid-19 was the sole cause of
death listed with no other pre-existing conditions from 2019 to 2021. Please
include average age of death if possible.

As per question 3.

5. What illnesses have you used a PCR test to diagnose other than Covid-19 (SARS
COV2) and what are the cycle rates (Threshold) used to diagnose each illness?
N/A — we don’t provide PCR tests

6. What is the cycle rate (threshold) used on the PCR test when testing for Covid)
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10.

11.

N/A — we don’t provide PCR tests

Does any individual within the organisation set the cycle rate (threshold) for PCR
testing? If so, please advise details. If not, please confirm where this decision
comes from.

N/A — we don’t provide PCR tests

Is the cycle rate (threshold) is the same for those who have received a Covid-19
vaccine and for those who have not received a Covid-19 vaccine when testing for
Covid-19? If not, please explain why.

N/A — we don’t provide PCR tests

How many doctors, nurses, admin or cleaning staff have died due to Covid-19
only?
Data not held.

Please provide the total number of ICU patients and/or beds used for patients
who have suffered from Covid-19 only between 2019 and 2021 listed by month.
Please supply both if possible.

Solent NHS Trust is a Mental Health and Community Service Trust and therefore this

guestion is N/A.

Please provide the total number of ICU patients and/or ICU beds used for
patients who have suffered side effects from Covid-19 vaccinations between
2019 and 2021 listed by month. Please supply both if possible.

Solent NHS Trust is a Mental Health and Community Service Trust and therefore this

guestion is N/A.



