
 

    

 

FOI_0387_22/22 – FOI request concerning - Waiting Times for 

Mental Health Admissions 

 

 

1. Please provide the total number of patients on a waiting list for admissions to 

mental health wards in your trust as of June 2021.  

N/A – Solent NHS Trust do not hold a waiting list for our mental health wards. 

 

2. Please provide the average time the patients have been waiting for an admission 

to mental health wards as of June 2021. 

N/A – Solent NHS Trust do not hold a waiting list for our mental health wards. 

 

3. Please provide the longest time a patient has been on the waiting list for an 

admission to mental health wards as of June 2021.  

N/A – Solent NHS Trust do not hold a waiting list for our mental health wards. 

 

4. Please provide the total capacity of your mental health wards, so how many 

patients overall can be on your wards at the same time as of June 2021.   

52  

 

5. Please provide the total number of inpatients, broken down into informal 

patients and those detained under the Mental Health Act as of 1st June 2021.  

Informal = 12 Mental Health Act section = 38 

 

 


